
Midland County Road Commission
AS AWARDED - 2025 Material Bid Tabulations - February 27, 2025

Contractor/vendor

Cadillac Culvert, 

Inc.

Jensen Bridge 

and Supply 

Com
pany

St. Regis Culvert, 

Inc.

Bid Item 2025-01 Culvert Pipe
Description Rate
Aluminized Type II Corrugated Metal Pipe
12" Diameter Ft 10.96 ^ 10.50 10.75
15" Diameter Ft 13.70 ^ 13.00 13.45
18" Diameter Ft 16.44 ^ 15.65 16.20
24" Diameter Ft 21.64 ^ 21.44 21.60
30" Diameter Ft 27.05 ^ 26.69 27.30
36" Diameter Ft 33.04 ^ 31.65 32.75
48" Diameter Ft 45.81 ^ 42.94 44.50
54" Diameter Ft 93.00 ^^ 64.64 # 56.75
60" Diameter Ft 103.00 ^^ 74.11 # 63.65
Metal End Section
12" Diameter Ea 55.00 50.00 55.00
15" Diameter Ea 65.00 60.00 70.00
18" Diameter Ea 77.00 73.00 90.00
24" Diameter Ea 120.00 120.00 145.00
30" Diameter Ea 225.00 220.00 375.00
36" Diameter Ea 420.00 420.00 550.00
48" Diameter Ea 1,600.00 1,190.00 1,200.00
54" Diameter Ea 2,000.00 1,500.00 1,435.00
60" Diameter Ea 2,600.00 2,000.00 2,152.00

Jensen Bridge Bid Comments: St. Regis Culvert Bid Comments:
^ 14 Gauge # 3x1
^^ 12 Gauge All prices firm 60 days from bid date
Pricing good for 60 days all sizes

No delivery charge or minimum
Terms 1%10, NET 30

Awarded Items

Sealed bids were opened on February 21st, 2025 at 12:00 pm
Bids were awarded at the regular board meeting on February 27th, 2025 at 9:00 am 1 of 8



Midland County Road Commission
AS AWARDED - 2025 Material Bid Tabulations - February 27, 2025

Contractor/vendor

Dornbos Sign & 

Safety Inc. 

Eberl Iron 

W
orks, Inc.

M
DSolutions

Bid Item 2025-02  Signs and Posts
Description Unit
Signs, As Needed

Sign, Type IIIA Sft 6.61 No Bid 6.75
Sign, Type IIIB Sft 6.61 No Bid 6.75
Sign, Type VB Sft 7.50 No Bid 9.00

3 LB/FT Steel Posts, Delivered in April 2025, Quantity: 100
4.5 FT Ea 14.52 21.34 18.19
10 FT Ea 31.21 46.61 40.88

3 LB/FT Steel Posts, As Needed
4.5 FT Ea 14.52 No Bid 18.19

6 FT Ea 18.73 No Bid 28.50
7 FT Ea 21.85 No Bid 33.25
8 FT Ea 24.97 No Bid 38.00
9 FT Ea 28.09 No Bid 42.75

10 FT Ea 31.21 No Bid 47.50
11 FT Ea 34.33 No Bid 52.25
12 FT Ea 37.45 No Bid 57.00
13 FT Ea 40.57 No Bid 61.75
14 FT Ea 43.70 No Bid 66.50
15 FT Ea 46.82 No Bid 71.25
16 FT Ea 49.94 No Bid 76.00

3 LB/FT Galvanized Steel Posts, As Needed
4.5 FT Ea 13.62 No Bid 18.19

6 FT Ea 23.59 No Bid 28.50
7 FT Ea 27.52 No Bid 33.25
8 FT Ea 31.45 No Bid 38.00
9 FT Ea 35.38 No Bid 42.75

10 FT Ea 39.31 No Bid 47.50

Sealed bids were opened on February 21st, 2025 at 12:00 pm
Bids were awarded at the regular board meeting on February 27th, 2025 at 9:00 am 2 of 8



Midland County Road Commission
AS AWARDED - 2025 Material Bid Tabulations - February 27, 2025

Contractor/vendor

Dornbos Sign & 

Safety Inc. 

Eberl Iron 

W
orks, Inc.

M
DSolutions

Bid Item 2025-02  Signs and Posts
Description Unit

11 FT Ea 43.24 No Bid 52.25
12 FT Ea 47.17 No Bid 57.00
13 FT Ea 51.10 No Bid 61.75
14 FT Ea 55.04 No Bid 66.50
15 FT Ea 58.97 No Bid 71.25
16 FT Ea 62.90 No Bid 76.00

Specialty Posts, Delivered in April 2025, Quantity: 200
7 FT Steel Delineator Post Ea 11.24 13.34 12.50

Specialty Posts, As Needed
7 FT Steel Delineator Post Ea 11.24 No Bid 13.50

6 FT Flexible Delineator Post w/ 3"x12" HIP Sheeting Ea 41.50 No Bid 65.00
Plastic Drum, Fluorescent, Furn, As Needed

Plastic Drum, Fluorescent, Furn Ea 78.30 No Bid 95.00
Channelizing Device, 42 inch, Fluorescent, Furn, As Needed

Channelizing Device, 42 inch, Fluorescent, Furn Ea 40.18 No Bid 65.00

Awarded Items

Sealed bids were opened on February 21st, 2025 at 12:00 pm
Bids were awarded at the regular board meeting on February 27th, 2025 at 9:00 am 3 of 8



Midland County Road Commission
AS AWARDED - 2025 Material Bid Tabulations - February 27, 2025

Contractor/vendor

Ace Saginaw 

Paving Co. North 

Division

Bid Item 2025-03 Cold Patch
Description Unit

CP-6 (Stylink) Ton No Bid
Alternate Material - (QPR High Performance) Ton 128.07

Awarded Items

Sealed bids were opened on February 21st, 2025 at 12:00 pm
Bids were awarded at the regular board meeting on February 27th, 2025 at 9:00 am 4 of 8



Midland County Road Commission
AS AWARDED - 2025 Material Bid Tabulations - February 27, 2025

Contractor/vendor

M
ichigan Paving 

& M
aterials 

Bid Item 2025-04 Spray Patch Mix Emulsions
Description Unit
Delivered to MCRC

AMS SP Gal 3.33
FOB/Point of Supply

AMS SP Gal 2.25
FOB/Point of Supply Location Alma

Awarded Items

Sealed bids were opened on February 21st, 2025 at 12:00 pm
Bids were awarded at the regular board meeting on February 27th, 2025 at 9:00 am 5 of 8



Midland County Road Commission
AS AWARDED - 2025 Material Bid Tabulations - February 27, 2025

Contractor/vendor

Action Traffic 

M
aintenance 

RM
D Holdings - 

Nationwide 

Construction 

Group 

Bid Item 2025-05 Guardrail Materials and Installation
Description Rate
Steel Beam Guardrail Materials and Installation

Mobilization & Traffic Control (County Road) Day 1,500.00 1,500.00
Mobilization & Traffic Control (MDOT Road) Day 1,500.00 1,500.00

Guardrail, Rem Ft 5.00 30.00
Guardrail, Curved, Type B Ft 27.65 30.00
Guardrail, Curved, Type T Ft 45.15 30.00

Guardrail, Type B Ft 19.85 40.00
Guardrail, Type T Ft 30.65 90.00

Guardrail, Type MGS-8 Ft 19.85 40.00
Guardrail Post, Culv Ea 400.00 400.00

Guardrail Approach, Terminal Type 1B Ea 2,550.00 4,000.00
Guardrail Approach, Terminal Type 1T Ea 2,750.00 4,700.00
Guardrail Approach, Terminal Type 2B Ea 2,675.00 2,700.00
Guardrail Approach, Terminal Type 2T Ea 2,725.00 4,700.00

Guardrail Approach, Terminal Type 2M Ea 2,675.00 4,000.00
Guardrail Approach, Terminal Type 3B Ea 5,050.00 5,000.00
Guardrail Approach, Terminal Type 3T Ea 5,335.00 5,000.00
Guardrail Departing Terminal, Type B Ea 995.00 1,000.00
Guardrail Departing Terminal, Type T Ea 1,050.00 1,000.00

Guardrail Departing Terminal, Type MGS Ea 950.00 1,000.00
Guardrail Anch, Bridge, Det M1 Ea 2,700.00 2,700.00
Guardrail Anch, Bridge, Det M2 Ea 3,175.00 3,000.00
Guardrail Anch, Bridge, Det M3 Ea 3,325.00 3,200.00
Guardrail Anch, Bridge, Det M4 Ea 2,750.00 3,000.00
Guardrail Anch, Bridge, Det M5 Ea 3,100.00 3,300.00
Guardrail Anch, Bridge, Det M6 Ea 3,200.00 3,450.00
Guardrail Anch, Bridge, Det M7 Ea 3,050.00 3,150.00

Sealed bids were opened on February 21st, 2025 at 12:00 pm
Bids were awarded at the regular board meeting on February 27th, 2025 at 9:00 am 6 of 8



Midland County Road Commission
AS AWARDED - 2025 Material Bid Tabulations - February 27, 2025

Contractor/vendor

Action Traffic 

M
aintenance 

RM
D Holdings - 

Nationwide 

Construction 

Group 

Bid Item 2025-05 Guardrail Materials and Installation
Description Rate

Guardrail Anch, Bridge, Det M8 Ea 3,200.00 3,400.00
Guardrail Anch, Bridge, Det M9 Ea 3,300.00 3,550.00
Guardrail Anch, Bridge, Det T1 Ea 1,900.00 1,600.00
Guardrail Anch, Bridge, Det T2 Ea 2,050.00 1,850.00
Guardrail Anch, Bridge, Det T3 Ea 2,350.00 2,050.00
Guardrail Anch, Bridge, Det T4 Ea 1,900.00 1,500.00
Guardrail Anch, Bridge, Det T5 Ea 2,400.00 2,200.00
Guardrail Anch, Bridge, Det T6 Ea 2,100.00 1,950.00

Guardrail Anch, Median Ea 2,200.00 2,000.00
Guardrail Reflector Ea 6.75 10.00

Nu-Guard-31 Roadside Barrier Materials & Installation
Nu-Guard Rib-Bak, 5 lb. x 6.5' Ea No Bid 100.00
Nu-Guard Rib-Bak, 5 lb. x 8.5' Ea No Bid 120.00

Nu-Guard, Washer, 3.5" D Ea No Bid 8.00
Nu-Guard-31 System, Installation County Wide Lft No Bid 50.00

Awarded Items

Sealed bids were opened on February 21st, 2025 at 12:00 pm
Bids were awarded at the regular board meeting on February 27th, 2025 at 9:00 am 7 of 8



Midland County Road Commission
AS AWARDED - 2025 Material Bid Tabulations - February 27, 2025

Contractor/vendor

Big Barney's 

Road 

M
aintenance, 

Inc.

Corrigan 

Environm
ental 

Solutions

Liquid Calcium
 

Chloride Sales, 

Inc.

M
ichigan 

Chloride Sales, 

LLC

Bid Item 2025-06 Dust Control and Anti-Icing Product
Description Rate
Applied County Wide

38% Liquid Calcium Chloride Applied Continuous Gal No Bid No Bid * 0.745 No Bid
Mineral Well Brine Applied Continuous Gal No Bid No Bid No Bid ~ 0.209

Bulk Delivery to MCRC Sanford
38% Liquid Calcium Chloride Delivered Gal No Bid No Bid * 0.715 No Bid

Mineral Well Brine Delivered Gal 0.550 No Bid *^ 0.589 ~ 0.177
Material Only

38% Liquid Calcium Chloride Picked up at Terminal Gal No Bid No Bid 0.597 No Bid
Mineral Well Brine Picked up at Terminal Gal No Bid No Bid ^ 0.481 # 0.080

Liquid Calcium Chloride Sales Bid Comments:
* Price based on 9,000 gallon loads
^ Alternate bid for 32% Liquidow

Michigan Chloride Sales Bid Comments:
~ Price based on 9,500 gallon loads
# Terms: Net 30, 1% 10 Days

Awarded Items

Sealed bids were opened on February 21st, 2025 at 12:00 pm
Bids were awarded at the regular board meeting on February 27th, 2025 at 9:00 am 8 of 8


