
Midland County Road Commission
AS AWARDED - 2025 Material Bid Tabulations - March 20, 2025

Contractor/vendor

NO BIDDERS

Bid Item 2025-09 Retaining Wall Block Materials
Description Unit

Face Block Ea No Bid
Corner Block Ea No Bid

Cap Block Ea No Bid

BidExpress bids were opened on March 20th, 2025 at 12:00pm
Bids were awarded at the regular board meeting on March 24th, 2025 at 9:00am 1 of 10



Midland County Road Commission
AS AWARDED - 2025 Material Bid Tabulations - March 20, 2025

Contractor/vendor

Bunting Sand & 

Gravel

Pats Gradall 

Andy Acker

Specification 

Stone Products

Fisher 

Transportation 

Com
pany Inc.

Bid Item 2025-10 Aggregates
Description Unit
22A 100% Crushed Limestone

Stockpiled Sanford Garage Ton No Bid No Bid 27.05 22.36
 Stockpiled Clay Pit Ton No Bid No Bid 27.30 22.85

Stockpiled Ingersoll Garage Ton No Bid No Bid 27.05 22.52
Stockpiled Jasper Garage Ton No Bid No Bid 29.05 24.50

Delivered Northwest Quadrant Ton No Bid No Bid 30.05 28.85
Delivered Northeast Quadrant Ton No Bid No Bid 30.05 27.85
Delivered Southwest Quadrant Ton No Bid No Bid 29.05 28.85
Delivered Southeast Quadrant Ton No Bid No Bid 29.05 26.85

23A 100% Crushed Limestone
Stockpiled Sanford Garage Ton No Bid No Bid 27.05 22.36

Stockpiled Clay Pit Ton No Bid No Bid 27.30 22.85
Stockpiled Ingersoll Garage Ton No Bid No Bid 27.05 22.52

Stockpiled Jasper Garage Ton No Bid No Bid 29.05 24.50
Delivered Northwest Quadrant Ton No Bid No Bid 30.05 28.85
Delivered Northeast Quadrant Ton No Bid No Bid 30.05 27.85
Delivered Southwest Quadrant Ton No Bid No Bid 29.05 28.85
Delivered Southeast Quadrant Ton No Bid No Bid 29.05 26.85

22A Road Gravel
Stockpiled Sanford Garage Ton 19.89 20.25 No Bid 17.89

Stockpiled Clay Pit Ton 19.89 20.25 No Bid 17.89
Stockpiled Ingersoll Garage Ton 21.79 22.25 No Bid 19.99

Stockpiled Jasper Garage Ton 23.04 22.25 No Bid 19.99
Delivered Northwest Quadrant Ton 20.00 No Bid No Bid 18.37
Delivered Northeast Quadrant Ton 20.00 No Bid No Bid 18.37
Delivered Southwest Quadrant Ton 23.00 No Bid No Bid 18.77

BidExpress bids were opened on March 20th, 2025 at 12:00pm
Bids were awarded at the regular board meeting on March 24th, 2025 at 9:00am 2 of 10



Midland County Road Commission
AS AWARDED - 2025 Material Bid Tabulations - March 20, 2025

Contractor/vendor

Bunting Sand & 

Gravel

Pats Gradall 

Andy Acker

Specification 

Stone Products

Fisher 

Transportation 

Com
pany Inc.

Bid Item 2025-10 Aggregates
Description Unit

Delivered Southeast Quadrant Ton 23.00 No Bid No Bid 20.45
23A Road Gravel

Stockpiled Sanford Garage Ton 19.89 20.25 No Bid 17.89
Stockpiled Clay Pit Ton 19.89 20.25 No Bid 17.89

Stockpiled Ingersoll Garage Ton 21.79 22.25 No Bid 19.99
Stockpiled Jasper Garage Ton 23.04 22.25 No Bid 19.99

Delivered Northwest Quadrant Ton 20.00 No Bid No Bid 18.37
Delivered Northeast Quadrant Ton 20.00 No Bid No Bid 18.37
Delivered Southwest Quadrant Ton 23.00 No Bid No Bid 18.77
Delivered Southeast Quadrant Ton 23.00 No Bid No Bid 20.45

2NS Sand
Stockpiled Sanford Garage Ton 17.40 No Bid No Bid 17.50

Class II (A) Sand
Stockpiled Sanford Garage Ton 14.37 10.25 No Bid 10.85

Stockpiled Clay Pit Ton 14.37 10.25 No Bid 10.85
Stockpiled Ingersoll Garage Ton 16.27 12.00 No Bid 14.15

Stockpiled Jasper Garage Ton 17.52 12.50 No Bid 10.86
Class III Sand

Stockpiled Sanford Garage Ton 14.37 10.25 No Bid 10.85
Stockpiled Clay Pit Ton 14.37 10.25 No Bid 10.85

Stockpiled Ingersoll Garage Ton 16.27 12.00 No Bid 14.15
Stockpiled Jasper Garage Ton 17.52 12.50 No Bid 10.86

Riprap, Plain
Stockpiled Sanford Garage Ton No Bid No Bid 78.40 86.37

Stockpiled Clay Pit Ton No Bid No Bid 78.55 86.37
Stockpiled Ingersoll Garage Ton No Bid No Bid 77.95 84.16

BidExpress bids were opened on March 20th, 2025 at 12:00pm
Bids were awarded at the regular board meeting on March 24th, 2025 at 9:00am 3 of 10



Midland County Road Commission
AS AWARDED - 2025 Material Bid Tabulations - March 20, 2025

Contractor/vendor

Bunting Sand & 

Gravel

Pats Gradall 

Andy Acker

Specification 

Stone Products

Fisher 

Transportation 

Com
pany Inc.

Bid Item 2025-10 Aggregates
Description Unit

Stockpiled Jasper Garage Ton No Bid No Bid 80.25 88.91
Riprap, Heavy

Stockpiled Sanford Garage Ton No Bid No Bid 84.95 91.37
Stockpiled Clay Pit Ton No Bid No Bid 85.55 91.37

Stockpiled Ingersoll Garage Ton No Bid No Bid 84.95 89.16
Stockpiled Jasper Garage Ton No Bid No Bid 87.25 93.91

Riprap, 3" x 5"
Stockpiled Sanford Garage Ton No Bid No Bid 38.60 40.33

Stockpiled Clay Pit Ton No Bid No Bid 39.18 41.00
Stockpiled Ingersoll Garage Ton No Bid No Bid 38.99 40.55

Stockpiled Jasper Garage Ton No Bid No Bid 41.28 43.25
H1 Sealcoat Stone

Stockpiled Sanford Garage Ton No Bid No Bid No Bid 33.25
Stockpiled Clay Pit Ton No Bid No Bid No Bid 34.00

Stockpiled Ingersoll Garage Ton No Bid No Bid No Bid 33.50
Stockpiled Jasper Garage Ton No Bid No Bid No Bid 36.50

Pick up at Terminal Ton No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Alternative Material to H1 Sealcoat Stone

Stockpiled Sanford Garage Ton No Bid No Bid *  31.55 No Bid
Stockpiled Clay Pit Ton No Bid No Bid *  31.80 No Bid

Stockpiled Ingersoll Garage Ton No Bid No Bid *  31.55 No Bid
Stockpiled Jasper Garage Ton No Bid No Bid *  33.55 No Bid

Pick up at Terminal Ton No Bid No Bid **  24.50 No Bid
29A Limestone - GRS Backfill

Stockpiled Sanford Garage Ton No Bid No Bid 31.55 30.25
Stockpiled Clay Pit Ton No Bid No Bid 31.80 30.80

BidExpress bids were opened on March 20th, 2025 at 12:00pm
Bids were awarded at the regular board meeting on March 24th, 2025 at 9:00am 4 of 10



Midland County Road Commission
AS AWARDED - 2025 Material Bid Tabulations - March 20, 2025

Contractor/vendor

Bunting Sand & 

Gravel

Pats Gradall 

Andy Acker

Specification 

Stone Products

Fisher 

Transportation 

Com
pany Inc.

Bid Item 2025-10 Aggregates
Description Unit

Stockpiled Ingersoll Garage Ton No Bid No Bid 31.55 30.43
Stockpiled Jasper Garage Ton No Bid No Bid 33.55 32.65

Pick up at Terminal Ton No Bid No Bid 24.50 No Bid
Other Information

V-Bottom haul units are available for delivery on-road? no answer no answer no answer Yes
Maximum amount (in Tons) that can be furnished per day? 1,000 no answer no answer 2,500

Specification Stone Products Bid Comments:
* 29A LS
** 29A LS, Wirt BC or Burroughs Essexville

Awarded Items

BidExpress bids were opened on March 20th, 2025 at 12:00pm
Bids were awarded at the regular board meeting on March 24th, 2025 at 9:00am 5 of 10



Midland County Road Commission
AS AWARDED - 2025 Material Bid Tabulations - March 20, 2025

Contractor/vendor

 Cadillac Culvert, 

Inc. 

Jensen Bridge 

and Supply 

Com
pany

St. Regis Culvert, 

Inc.

Bid Item 2025-11  Large Culvert Supply
Description Unit
Aluminized Type II Corrugated Metal Pipe

112" x 75" Arch, 10 Gauge, 46 Ft Lsum *  9,235.42 #  7,720.64 ^  8,691.70
137" x 87" Arch, 10 Gauge, 57 Ft Lsum *  13,562.58 #  11,202.78 ^  12,796.50
142" x 91" Arch, 10 Gauge, 60 Ft Lsum *  14,982.60 #  12,338.60 ^  14,160.00

Cadillac Culvert Bid Comments:
* $50.00 each for lifting lugs 

Jensen Bridge and Supply Bid Comments:

# 1 piece

St. Regis Culvert Bid Comments:
^ Prices are firm for 30 days and void thereafter
^ Delivery by above dates based on raw material availability
^ Terms: 1% Net 10 or Net 30 Days 

Awarded Items

BidExpress bids were opened on March 20th, 2025 at 12:00pm
Bids were awarded at the regular board meeting on March 24th, 2025 at 9:00am 6 of 10



Midland County Road Commission
AS AWARDED - 2025 Material Bid Tabulations - March 20, 2025

Contractor/vendor

Bid Item 2025-12 Geotextiles and Erosion Control
Description Unit
Material Only Unit Price Syd/Roll Unit Price Syd/Roll

Geotextile Liner, Non Woven Roll 600.00 500 *  450.00 500
Heavy Geotextile Liner, Non Woven Roll 900.00 500 **  700.00 500

High Strength Woven Polypropylene Roll 1,325.00 500 ***  880.00 500
Medium Strength Woven Polypropylene Roll 900.00 500 ****  745.00 500

Material Only
Silt Fence, Fabricated Roll 48.00 33.33 ^  44.00 33.33

High Velocity Straw Mulch Blanket Roll 27.50 100 ^^  32.00 100
Single Net Straw Mulch Blanket Roll 32.50 100 ^^^  29.00 100

Hanes Geo Components Bid Comments:
*  TerraTex N08 12.5'x360' or 15'x300'
**  TerraTex N11 15'x300' 
***  TerraTex HPG 57 15'x300' 
****  TerraTex HPG 27 15'x300' 
^  3'x100' MDOT sf 
^^  doublenet straw 8'x112.5' 
^^^  singlenet straw 8'x112.5' 

ETNA Supply Co 

(Chesterfield, 

M
I)

 Hanes Geo 

Com
ponents 

Awarded Items

BidExpress bids were opened on March 20th, 2025 at 12:00pm
Bids were awarded at the regular board meeting on March 24th, 2025 at 9:00am 7 of 10



Midland County Road Commission
AS AWARDED - 2025 Material Bid Tabulations - March 20, 2025

Contractor/vendor

J&N 

Construction, 

LLC

Pavem
ent 

Recycling Inc.

Shaw 

Contracting Co.

Bid Item 2025-13 Pulverization
Description Unit
Pulverize to depth < 8"

Equipment Rate Hr 1,160.00 750.00 990.00
Pulverize/Compact Syd 0.87 0.84 1.33

Pulverize to depth 8" - 12"
Equipment Rate Hr 1,160.00 750.00 990.00

Pulverize/Compact Syd 1.09 1.00 1.99

Awarded Items

BidExpress bids were opened on March 20th, 2025 at 12:00pm
Bids were awarded at the regular board meeting on March 24th, 2025 at 9:00am 8 of 10



Midland County Road Commission
AS AWARDED - 2025 Material Bid Tabulations - March 20, 2025

Contractor/vendor

 Hanes Geo 

Com
ponents 

Bid Item 2025-14 Hydroseed Materials
Description Unit

Seed Bag *  71.50
Mulch Bale **  21.43

Fertilizer Bag ***  16.50

Hanes Geo Components Bid Comments:

* IN STOCK 50# bag MDOT highway roadside, I have another mix 45% 
PRG-45%CRF-10KBG that meets all purity and germ requirements-
slight lead time. Price is $75/50#bag.

* MDOT Hwy Roadside Seed Mix:
   50% Perennial Ryegrass
   35% Creeping Red Fescue
   15% Kentuckuy Bluegrass 85/80

** IN STOCK Profile paper w tac 50# bale

*** IN STOCK 19-0-19 fertilizer 50# bag

Awarded Items

BidExpress bids were opened on March 20th, 2025 at 12:00pm
Bids were awarded at the regular board meeting on March 24th, 2025 at 9:00am 9 of 10



Midland County Road Commission
AS AWARDED - 2025 Material Bid Tabulations - March 20, 2025

Contractor/vendor

Set In Stone

Bid Item 2025-15 Precast Concrete Deck Panel System
Description Unit

Precast Concrete Deck Panel System, 30’ long Lsum *  63,750.00
Precast Concrete Deck Panel System, 32’ long Lsum *  68,900.00
Precast Concrete Deck Panel System, 35’ long Lsum *  71,500.00
Precast Concrete Deck Panel System, 37’ long Lsum *  83,000.00
Precast Concrete Deck Panel System, 39’ long Lsum *  102,000.00
Precast Concrete Deck Panel System, 42’ long Lsum No Bid
Precast Concrete Deck Panel System, 45’ long Lsum No Bid
Precast Concrete Deck Panel System, 47’ long Lsum No Bid

Set In Stone Comments:
*  Skewed panels will have additional fees

Awarded Items

BidExpress bids were opened on March 20th, 2025 at 12:00pm
Bids were awarded at the regular board meeting on March 24th, 2025 at 9:00am 10 of 10


