Midland County Road Commission
AS AWARDED - 2026 Material Bid Tabulations - March 12, 2026
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Bid Item 2026-06 HMA Paving Program West of M-30
MAINLINE PROJECTS
Description Unit
HMA, 5EL Ton 77.46 74.08 79.70 71.95
HMA, 4EL Ton 72.76 69.23 75.10 70.15
HMA Wedging, Partial Lane Ton 167.42 90.52 92.35 136.62
HMA Wedging, Full Lane Ton 120.87 90.52 92.35 118.22
HMA, Approach Ton 150.00 150.00 150.00 164.00
HMA, Ultra-Thin, Medium Volume, Modified Ton 150.00 132.30 150.00 181.50
Shoulder, Class Il Ton 40.70 28.43 32.70 37.10
MINOR PROJECTS
Description Unit
HMA, 5EL Ton 81.77 94.63 87.80 84.25
HMA, 4EL Ton 76.54 88.26 87.80 79.79
HMA Wedging, Partial Lane Ton 167.42 117.38 92.35 240.97
HMA Wedging, Full Lane Ton 120.87 117.38 92.35 151.16
HMA, Approach Ton 150.00 150.00 150.00 164.00
HMA, Ultra-Thin, Medium Volume, Modified Ton 150.00 132.30 150.00 181.50
Shoulder, Class Il Ton 40.70 45.65 42.30 47.97

Mainline Projects are all projects that are greater than 1/4 of a mile in length and not located on a Dead End road.

Minor Projects are projects that are less than or equal to 1/4 of a mile in length, OR projects of any length that are on a Dead End road.

Awarded Items

BidExpress bids were opened on March 10th, 2026 at 12:00 pm
Bids were awarded at the regular board meeting on March 12th, 2026 at 9:00 am
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Bid Item 2026-07 HMA Paving Program East of M-30
MAINLINE PROJECTS
Description Unit
HMA, 5EL Ton 76.85 76.98 76.20 74.15
HMA, 4EL Ton 72.45 73.18 73.45 69.73
HMA Wedging, Partial Lane Ton 102.75 85.25 72.45 85.92
HMA Wedging, Full Lane Ton 102.75 85.25 72.45 82.96
HMA, Approach Ton 102.75 150.00 150.00 164.00
HMA, Ultra-Thin, Medium Volume, Modified Ton 114.00 132.30 150.00 181.50
Shoulder, Class Il Ton 41.91 34.35 35.05 36.80
MINOR PROJECTS
Description Unit
HMA, 5EL Ton 85.14 84.30 84.30 80.20
HMA, 4EL Ton 79.68 80.59 75.00 76.83
HMA Wedging, Partial Lane Ton 102.75 95.84 92.35 181.97
HMA Wedging, Full Lane Ton 102.75 95.84 92.35 168.61
HMA, Approach Ton 102.75 150.00 150.00 164.00
HMA, Ultra-Thin, Medium Volume, Modified Ton 114.00 132.20 106.25 113.11
Shoulder, Class Il Ton 41.91 35.00 46.75 51.16

Mainline Projects are all projects that are greater than 1/4 of a mile in length and not located on a Dead End road.

Minor Projects are projects that are less than or equal to 1/4 of a mile in length, OR projects of any length that are on a Dead End road.

Awarded Items

BidExpress bids were opened on March 10th, 2026 at 12:00 pm
Bids were awarded at the regular board meeting on March 12th, 2026 at 9:00 am
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AS AWARDED - 2026 Material Bid Tabulations - March 12, 2026

BidExpress bids were opened on March 10th, 2026 at 12:00 pm

Bids were awarded at the regular board meeting on March 12th, 2026 at 9:00 am
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Bid Item 2026-08 Chip Seal Program
Description Unit
Single Chip Seal Syd 2.26 2.32 2.41
Double Chip Seal Syd 4.50 4.50 4.48
Fog Seal Syd 0.45 0.51 0.47
Temp Raised Pavt Mrk, Yellow Ea 2.00 2.00 1.75
Temp Raised Pavt Mrk, White Ea 2.00 2.00 1.75
Awarded Items

30f11



Midland County Road Commission
AS AWARDED - 2026 Material Bid Tabulations - March 12, 2026

2 3 % S Y
(?"}‘ \g 2, % 7’:29 2 L %/ % A
% % % Q, '@ % Q Q> 4 QR 3
Contractor/vendor % 5 A % o % % G % %S
% B\ % 2 % s % 24\ 2 e%
4 (1 ‘2 D 2 > < = >, 0, ©
2%\ % 2 % % B\ 27
Bid Item 2026-09 Overband Crack Fill
Description Unit
Overband Crack Fill Rdmi 8,200.00 4,299.00 4,150.00 6,815.00 4,420.00 6,500.00
Overband Crack Fill Lb 1.50 1.49 1.40 1.48 1.19 1.30
* Overband Crack Fill, Parking Lot item has been removed from this bid.
Awarded Items
BidExpress bids were opened on March 10th, 2026 at 12:00 pm
Bids were awarded at the regular board meeting on March 12th, 2026 at 9:00 am 40f11
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BidExpress bids were opened on March 10th, 2026 at 12:00 pm

Bids were awarded at the regular board meeting on March 12th, 2026 at 9:00 am
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Bid Item 2026-10 Pavement Markings
Description Unit
Pavement Markings - Estimated miles: 320 +/-
Pavement Marking, waterborne, 4 inch yellow Ft 0.055 0.062 0.063
Pavement Marking, waterborne, 4 inch white Ft 0.054 0.060 0.063
Special Pavement Marking Items
Rem Spec Mrkg Sft 1.50 1.00 2.95
Pavt Mrkg, Ovly Cold Plastic, Yield Ea 175.00 270.00 225.00
Pavt Mrkg, Ovly Cold Plastic, Only Ea 150.00 240.00 185.00
Pavt Mrkg, Ovly Cold Plastic, 24 inch Stop Bar Ft 10.00 12.00 12.50
Pavt Mrkg, Ovly Cold Plastic, Lt Turn Arrow Sym Ea 150.00 170.00 185.00
Pavt Mrkg, Ovly Cold Plastic, Rt Turn Arrow Sym Ea 150.00 170.00 185.00
Pavt Mrkg, Ovly Cold Plastic, Thru and Lt Turn Arrow Sym Ea 225.00 300.00 250.00
Pavt Mrkg, Ovly Cold Plastic, Thru and Rt Turn Arrow Sym Ea 225.00 300.00 250.00
Pavt Mrkg, Ovly Cold Plastic, 12 inch, Cross Hatching, White Ft 6.00 8.00 6.50
Pavt Mrkg, Ovly Cold Plastic, 12 inch, Crosswalk Ft 6.00 8.00 6.50
Awarded Items
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Bid Item 2026-11 Aggregates
Description Unit
22A 100% Crushed Limestone
Stockpiled Sanford Garage Ton No Bid 28.60 24.23
Stockpiled Clay Pit Ton No Bid 28.85 24.75
Stockpiled Ingersoll Garage Ton No Bid 28.35 24.40
Stockpiled Jasper Garage Ton No Bid 30.10 26.50
Delivered Northwest Quadrant Ton No Bid 30.85 29.59
Delivered Northeast Quadrant Ton No Bid 29.85 28.57
Delivered Southwest Quadrant Ton No Bid 31.35 29.59
Delivered Southeast Quadrant Ton No Bid 29.35 27.54
23A 100% Crushed Limestone
Stockpiled Sanford Garage Ton No Bid 28.60 24.23
Stockpiled Clay Pit Ton No Bid 28.85 24.75
Stockpiled Ingersoll Garage Ton No Bid 28.35 24.40
Stockpiled Jasper Garage Ton No Bid 30.10 26.50
Delivered Northwest Quadrant Ton No Bid 30.85 29.59
Delivered Northeast Quadrant Ton No Bid 29.85 28.57
Delivered Southwest Quadrant Ton No Bid 31.35 29.59
Delivered Southeast Quadrant Ton No Bid 29.35 27.54
22A Road Gravel
Stockpiled Sanford Garage Ton No Bid No Bid 17.89
Stockpiled Clay Pit Ton No Bid No Bid 17.89
Stockpiled Ingersoll Garage Ton No Bid No Bid 19.99
Stockpiled Jasper Garage Ton No Bid No Bid 19.99
Delivered Northwest Quadrant Ton No Bid No Bid 18.37
Delivered Northeast Quadrant Ton No Bid No Bid 18.37
Delivered Southwest Quadrant Ton No Bid No Bid 18.77
Delivered Southeast Quadrant Ton No Bid No Bid 20.45

BidExpress bids were opened on March 10th, 2026 at 12:00 pm
Bids were awarded at the regular board meeting on March 12th, 2026 at 9:00 am 6 of 11
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Bid Item 2026-11 Aggregates
Description Unit
23A Road Gravel
Stockpiled Sanford Garage Ton No Bid No Bid 17.89
Stockpiled Clay Pit Ton No Bid No Bid 17.89
Stockpiled Ingersoll Garage Ton No Bid No Bid 19.99
Stockpiled Jasper Garage Ton No Bid No Bid 19.99
Delivered Northwest Quadrant Ton No Bid No Bid 18.37
Delivered Northeast Quadrant Ton No Bid No Bid 18.37
Delivered Southwest Quadrant Ton No Bid No Bid 18.77
Delivered Southeast Quadrant Ton No Bid No Bid 20.45
2NS Sand
Stockpiled Sanford Garage Ton No Bid No Bid 17.75
Class Il (A) Sand
Stockpiled Sanford Garage Ton 10.84 No Bid 10.35
Stockpiled Clay Pit Ton 10.84 No Bid 10.35
Stockpiled Ingersoll Garage Ton 12.00 No Bid 12.25
Stockpiled Jasper Garage Ton 12.50 No Bid 12.25
Class Ill Sand
Stockpiled Sanford Garage Ton 10.84 No Bid 10.35
Stockpiled Clay Pit Ton 10.84 No Bid 10.35
Stockpiled Ingersoll Garage Ton 12.00 No Bid 12.25
Stockpiled Jasper Garage Ton 12.50 No Bid 12.25
Riprap, Plain
Stockpiled Sanford Garage Ton No Bid 86.20 92.74
Stockpiled Clay Pit Ton No Bid 86.50 92.74
Stockpiled Ingersoll Garage Ton No Bid 86.50 90.44
Stockpiled Jasper Garage Ton No Bid 89.50 95.36
Riprap, Heavy

BidExpress bids were opened on March 10th, 2026 at 12:00 pm
Bids were awarded at the regular board meeting on March 12th, 2026 at 9:00 am
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Bid Item 2026-11 Aggregates
Description Unit
Stockpiled Sanford Garage Ton No Bid 93.20 98.24
Stockpiled Clay Pit Ton No Bid 93.50 98.24
Stockpiled Ingersoll Garage Ton No Bid 93.50 95.94
Stockpiled Jasper Garage Ton No Bid 96.50 100.86
Riprap, 3" x 5"
Stockpiled Sanford Garage Ton No Bid 44.80 42.70
Stockpiled Clay Pit Ton No Bid 45.05 43.40
Stockpiled Ingersoll Garage Ton No Bid 44.55 42.93
Stockpiled Jasper Garage Ton No Bid 46.30 45.75
H1 Sealcoat Stone
Stockpiled Sanford Garage Ton No Bid 35.85 34.64
Stockpiled Clay Pit Ton No Bid 37.05 35.40
Stockpiled Ingersoll Garage Ton No Bid 35.05 34.89
Stockpiled Jasper Garage Ton No Bid 35.80 37.95
Pick up at Terminal Ton No Bid 28.55 No Bid
Alternative Material to H1 Sealcoat Stone
Stockpiled Sanford Garage Ton No Bid 33.70 No Bid
Stockpiled Clay Pit Ton No Bid 33.95 No Bid
Stockpiled Ingersoll Garage Ton No Bid 33.45 No Bid
Stockpiled Jasper Garage Ton No Bid 35.20 No Bid
Pick up at Terminal Ton No Bid 26.95 No Bid
29A Limestone - GRS Backfill
Stockpiled Sanford Garage Ton No Bid 33.70 31.53
Stockpiled Clay Pit Ton No Bid 33.95 32.10
Stockpiled Ingersoll Garage Ton No Bid 33.45 31.72
Stockpiled Jasper Garage Ton No Bid 35.20 34.00
Pick up at Terminal Ton No Bid 26.95 No Bid

BidExpress bids were opened on March 10th, 2026 at 12:00 pm
Bids were awarded at the regular board meeting on March 12th, 2026 at 9:00 am 8of 11
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Bid Item 2026-11 Aggregates
Description Unit
Other Information
V-Bottom haul units are available for delivery on-road?| Not Specified Not Specified Yes
Maximum amount (in Tons) that can be furnished per day?| Not Specified Not Specified 2,500
Awarded Items

BidExpress bids were opened on March 10th, 2026 at 12:00 pm
Bids were awarded at the regular board meeting on March 12th, 2026 at 9:00 am 90of11
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Bid Item 2026-12 Micro-Surface
Description Unit
Micro-Surface, Rutfilling Ton 292.00 307.00
Micro-Surface Syd 5.07 6.19
Micro-Surface, Single Cse Syd 4.18 3.61
Temp Raised Pavt Mark, Yellow Ea 1.75 1.80
Temp Raised Pavt Mark, White Ea 1.75 1.70

BidExpress bids were opened on March 10th, 2026 at 12:00 pm
Bids were awarded at the regular board meeting on March 12th, 2026 at 9:00 am

Awarded Items

10 of 11



Midland County Road Commission
AS REJECTED - 2026 Material Bid Tabulations - March 12, 2026

A %
%, % %
Contractor/vendor % 2 ®,
Y e o
> K
©
Bid Item 2026-13 Snow Fence and Posts
Description Unit
Snow Fence, 4 Ft Tall, 4,000 ft
Snow Fence, 4 Ft Tall ft No Bid *%0,23
Steel T-Posts, 7 Ft Long, 500 each
Steel T-Posts, 7 Ft Long Ea *12.10 *%9.40

Eberl Iron Works, Inc
* This is the unit price per post.

**Elite Textile Trading LLC

This is the calculated unit price based on bidder provided total price of $920 for Snow Fence.
This is the calculated unit price based on bidder provided total price of $4,700 for Steel T-Posts.

Rejected Items

BidExpress bids were opened on March 10th, 2026 at 12:00 pm
Bids were rejected at the regular board meeting on March 12th, 2026 at 9:00 am
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